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1 Cal1

CalcPal® Storage Calculator Package: Texas Instruments® 

TI-108 Basic Calculator (30 calculators) Each 60 EAI EDUCATION 164.00                       9,840.00 EAI Education and Texas Instruments 562076

CalcPal® Storage Calculator Package: Texas Instruments® TI-108 Basic Calculator. 

Includes: (30) TI-108 Basic Calculators and (1) Calc-Pal Standard Storage Pocket Chart.

1 Cal1

CalcPal® Storage Calculator Package: Texas Instruments® 

TI-108 Basic Calculator (30 calculators) Each 60 The Bach Company   No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 Cal2

CalcSAFE® Jr. Calculator Package: Texas Instruments® TI-

108 Basic Calculator (30 calculators) Each 60 EAI EDUCATION 164.00                       9,840.00 EAI Education and Texas Instruments 562066

CalcSAFE® Jr. Calculator Package: Texas Instruments® TI-108 Basic Calculator. Includes:  

(30) Texas Instruments® TI-108 basic calculators and (1) CalcSAFE® Jr. Primary Storage 

Case

2 Cal2

CalcSAFE® Jr. Calculator Package: Texas Instruments® TI-

108 Basic Calculator (30 calculators) Each 60 The Bach Company   No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Cal3

Texas Instruments® TI-108 Basic Calculator - Teacher 

Pack (10 Calculators) Each 180 EAI EDUCATION 43.40                       7,812.00 Texas Instruments 70003-001

Texas Instruments® TI-108 Basic Calculator - Teacher Pack (10 Calculators).  Include: 10 

calculators packed in a box, teachers guide, and poster.

3 Cal3

Texas Instruments® TI-108 Basic Calculator - Teacher 

Pack (10 Calculators) Each 180 The Bach Company 43.80                       7,884.00 Texas Instruments TI-108 TK Texas Instruments® TI-108 Basic Calculator - Teacher Pack (10 Calculators)

3 Cal3

Texas Instruments® TI-108 Basic Calculator - Teacher 

Pack (10 Calculators) Each 180 Lakeshore Learning 69.29                     12,472.20 Texas Instruments Lakeshore Item #NZ18

This easy-to-use, top-quality calculator features color-coded command keys, a 

correction function, memory, an 8-digit display and automatic shutoff. Calculator runs 

on solar power and measures 4 1/2"" in length.  Set of 10

4 Cal4 Texas Instruments® TI-108 Basic Calculator Each 240 EAI EDUCATION 4.34                       1,041.60 Texas Instruments 70001 Texas Instruments® TI-108 Basic Calculator. Single Calculator

4 Cal4 Texas Instruments® TI-108 Basic Calculator Each 240 The Bach Company 4.38                       1,051.20 Texas Instruments TI-108 Single Texas Instruments® TI-108 Basic Calculator

4 Cal4 Texas Instruments® TI-108 Basic Calculator Each 240 Lakeshore Learning 7.19                       1,725.60 Texas Instruments Lakeshore Item #NZ8

This easy-to-use, top-quality calculator features color-coded command keys, a 

correction function, memory, an 8-digit display and automatic shutoff. Calculator runs 

on solar power and measures 4 1/2"" in length. 

5 Cal5

CalcPal® Storage Calculator Package: Texas Instruments® 

TI-30XS MultiView Scientific Calculator (30 calculators) Each 60 EAI EDUCATION 420.00                     25,200.00 EAI Education and Texas Instruments 562079

CalcPal® Storage Calculator Package: Texas Instruments® TI-30XS MultiView Scientific 

Calculator. Package includes (30) TI-30XS Multiview scientific calculators and (1) 

CalcPal® storage pocket chart.

5 Cal5

CalcPal® Storage Calculator Package: Texas Instruments® 

TI-30XS MultiView Scientific Calculator (30 calculators) Each 60 The Bach Company   No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 Cal6

CalcSAFE® Jr. Calculator Package: Texas Instruments® TI-

30XS MultiView Scientific Calculator  (30 calculators) Each 60 EAI EDUCATION 430.00                     25,800.00 EAI Education and Texas Instruments 562069

CalcSAFE® Jr. Calculator Package: Texas Instruments® TI-30XS MultiView Scientific 

Calculator. Includes: (30) TI-30XS Multiview scientific calculators and (1) CalcSAFE® Jr. 

Scientific Storage Case.

6 Cal6

CalcSAFE® Jr. Calculator Package: Texas Instruments® TI-

30XS MultiView Scientific Calculator  (30 calculators) Each 60 The Bach Company   No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 Cal7

Texas Instruments® TI-30XS MultiView™ EZ-Spot 

Scientific Calculator Each 240 EAI EDUCATION 13.15                       3,156.00 Texas Instruments 70337

Texas Instruments® TI-30XS MultiView™ EZ-Spot Scientific Calculator. Includes a 

protective slide case.

7 Cal7

Texas Instruments® TI-30XS MultiView™ EZ-Spot 

Scientific Calculator Each 240 The Bach Company 13.47                       3,232.80 Texas Instruments TI-30XS Multiview Single Texas Instruments® TI-30XS MultiView™ EZ-Spot Scientific Calculator

8 Cal8

CalcSAFE® Bundle: Texas Instruments® TI-84 Plus CE EZ-

Spot Graphing Calculator KIT  (30 calculators and 3 

charging stations) Each 120 EAI EDUCATION 4,092.00                   491,040.00 EAI Education and Texas Instruments 561816

CalcSAFE® Bundle: Texas Instruments® TI-84 Plus CE Graphing Calculators and Stations 

(KIT). includes: 30 EZ-Spot TI-84 Plus CE Graphing Calculators, 3 TI-84 Plus CE Charging 

Stations, 15 USB Computer Cables, 15 USB Unit-to-Unit Cables, 3 Getting Started 

Guides, 3 Classroom Posters, 1 CalcSAFE™ with room for 30 calculators, 3 charging 

stations, and accessories.

8 Cal8

CalcSAFE® Bundle: Texas Instruments® TI-84 Plus CE EZ-

Spot Graphing Calculator KIT  (30 calculators and 3 Each 120 The Bach Company   No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 Cal9

Texas Instruments® TI-84 Plus CE Graphing Calculator (30 

calculators) Each 120 EAI EDUCATION 3,695.40                   443,448.00 Texas Instruments 561082X30

Texas Instruments® TI-84 Plus CE Graphing Calculator. Includes 30 Single Calculators 

each with a rechargeable battery, slide case an a USB cable.

9 Cal9

Texas Instruments® TI-84 Plus CE Graphing Calculator (30 

calculators) Each 120 The Bach Company 3,698.69                   443,842.80 Texas Instruments

TI-84Plus CE Class Pack without 

Charging Stations

Texas Instruments® TI-84 Plus CE Graphing Calculator (30 calculators and no charging 

stations)
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10 Cal10

Texas Instruments® TI-84 Plus CE EZ-Spot Graphing 

Calculator Teacher Pack (10 Calculators) Each 240 EAI EDUCATION 1,291.50                   309,960.00 Texas Instruments 561083

Texas Instruments® TI-84 Plus CE EZ-Spot Graphing Calculator Teacher Pack (10 

Calculators). Includes:  10 EZ-Spot units with rechargeable batteries, 5 USB unit-to-

computer cables, 5 unit-to-unit cables, 1 TI-84 Plus CE Charging Station, 1 Getting 

Started Guide, 1 classroom poster, 1 Year Teacher Software Subscription.

10 Cal10

Texas Instruments® TI-84 Plus CE EZ-Spot Graphing 

Calculator Teacher Pack (10 Calculators) Each 240 The Bach Company 1,296.69                   311,205.60 Texas Instruments

TI-84 Plus CE EZ-Spot Graphing 

Calculator Teacher Pack (10 

Texas Instruments® TI-84 Plus CE EZ-Spot Graphing Calculator Teacher Pack (10 

Calculators) without charging station

11 Cal11 Texas Instruments® TI-84 Plus CE EZ-Spot Slide Cases - Each 120 EAI EDUCATION 31.95                       3,834.00 Texas Instruments 505231 Texas Instruments® TI-84 Plus CE EZ-Spot Slide Cases - Pack of 10

11 Cal11

Texas Instruments® TI-84 Plus CE EZ-Spot Slide Cases - 

Pack of 10 Each 120 The Bach Company 35.00                       4,200.00 Texas Instruments

TI-84 Plus CE EZ-Spot Slide Cases - 

Pack of 10 Texas Instruments® TI-84 Plus CE EZ-Spot Slide Cases - Pack of 10

12 Cal12 Texas Instruments® TI-84 Plus CE Charging Station Each 120 EAI EDUCATION 63.54                       7,624.80 Texas Instruments 561094 Texas Instruments® TI-84 Plus CE Charging Station

12 Cal12 Texas Instruments® TI-84 Plus CE Charging Station Each 120 The Bach Company 66.00                       7,920.00 Texas Instruments TI-84 Plus CE Charging Station Texas Instruments® TI-84 Plus CE Charging Station

13 Cal13

CalcSAFE® Graphing Calculator and Station Rolling 

Storage Case Each 120 EAI EDUCATION 152.95                     18,354.00 EAI Education and Texas Instruments 520877

CalcSAFE® Graphing Calculator and Station Storage Case. Holds 30 calculators in their 

own numbered, padded slot. Two compartments for storing 3 charging stations, plus a 

space for cables and wires. Includes a zippered pouch for accessories, a foam block to 

keep smaller charging stations secure, and a lock. 

13 Cal13

CalcSAFE® Graphing Calculator and Station Rolling 

Storage Case Each 120 The Bach Company   No Bid No Bid No Bid

14 Cal14

CalcSAFE® Bundle: Texas Instruments® TI-Nspire™ CX II 

EZ-Spot Graphing Calculators and Stations (KIT)  (30 

calculators) Each 12 EAI EDUCATION 4,477.50                     53,730.00 EAI Education and Texas Instruments 561814

CalcSAFE® Bundle: Texas Instruments® TI-Nspire™ CX II EZ-Spot Graphing Calculators 

and Stations (KIT).  includes: 30 CX II EZ Spot Graphing calculators, Quick Reference 

Card, Getting Started Guide, 15 Unit-to-Unit Cables, 30 Unit-to-Computer USB cables, 3 

Docking Stations, 90-day trial of the TI-Nspire™ CX Premium Teacher Software. Plus 1 

CalcSAFE® with storage for 30 calculators, 3 charging stations, and cables.

14 Cal14

CalcSAFE® Bundle: Texas Instruments® TI-Nspire™ CX II 

EZ-Spot Graphing Calculators and Stations (KIT)  (30 Each 12 The Bach Company   No Bid No Bid No Bid

15 Cal15

CalcSAFE® Bundle: Texas Instruments® TI-Nspire™ CX II 

EZ Spot (KIT)  (30 calculators) Each 12 EAI EDUCATION 4,472.50                     53,670.00 EAI Education and Texas Instruments 561766

CalcSAFE® Bundle: Texas Instruments® TI-Nspire™ CX II EZ-Spot Graphing Calculators 

(KIT).  includes: 30 CX II EZ Spot Graphing calculators, Quick Reference Card, Getting 

Started Guide, 15 Unit-to-Unit Cables, 30 Unit-to-Computer USB cables, 3 Docking 

Stations, 90-day trial of the TI-Nspire™ CX Premium Teacher Software. Plus 1 

CalcSAFE® with storage for 30 calculators. 

15 Cal15

CalcSAFE® Bundle: Texas Instruments® TI-Nspire™ CX II 

EZ Spot (KIT)  (30 calculators) Each 12 The Bach Company   No Bid No Bid No Bid

16 Cal16 Texas Instruments® TI-Nspire CX Docking Station Each 12 EAI EDUCATION 120.50                       1,446.00 Texas Instruments 560426 Texas Instruments® TI-Nspire CX Docking Station

16 Cal16 Texas Instruments® TI-Nspire CX Docking Station Each 12 The Bach Company 126.00                       1,512.00 Texas Instruments TI-Nspire CX Docking Station Texas Instruments® TI-Nspire CX Docking Station
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